0 ~NO OB WON -

W W W WWWWWWNDNDNDNDDNDNMNDMDNDNDMNDN-2A 222 22 A a3 23 2 a2 A
%OO\IOU'ILQDI\)—\O(OOO\ICDU'I-POONAOCOOO\IO)U'I-POON—-\O©

Introduced July 24, 2007, by Councilman
Kingston, seconded by Councilman Canada,
(by request of Administration)

ltem No. 07-07-2667
ORDINANCE NO. 3418

An ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the City of Slidell, Chapter
6 Animals, relative to fees for redemption of impounded animals.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED by the Slidell City Council that it does
hereby amend Chapter 6 Animals, Sec. 6-36 as follows:
Sec. 6-36. Redemption of impounded animals.
In paragraph (a) delete “$25.00" and replace with “$50.00".
In paragraph (a) delete “$50.00 and replace with “$75.00".

In paragraph (a) delete “$100.00” and replace with “$125.00".

ADOPTED this 28th day of August, 2007.

NI

Vige President of the Council
Councilman, District E

&30lo7  tothe Mayor

RECEIVED
. 4700 P~

%&o 6) Q&\ﬁ\h’) from the ngor
Thomas P. Reeves

DELIVERED 3} qﬁ.p-m .

Council Administrator



